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82a-733. Conservation	plans	and	practices.	(a)	The	chief	engineer	may	require	an	applicant	for	a	permit
to	appropriate	water	for	beneficial	use	or	the	owner	of	a	water	right	or	permit	to	appropriate	water	for	beneficial
use	to	adopt	and	implement	conservation	plans	and	practices.	The	chief	engineer	shall	not	mandate	the	adoption
and	 implementation	 of	 conservation	 plans	 and	 practices	 except	 pursuant	 to	 a	 finding	 that	 such	 plans	 and
practices	 will	 assure	 public	 benefit	 and	 promote	 public	 interest.	 In	 selecting	 the	 applications,	 water	 rights	 or
permits	 for	 which	 conservation	 plans	 and	 practices	 are	 required	 to	 be	 adopted	 and	 implemented,	 the	 chief
engineer	shall	give	priority	to:	(1)	Water	users	that	share	a	common	source	of	supply	that	could	be	insufficient
during	 times	 of	 drought;	 (2)	 water	 users	 whose	 use	 is	 significantly	 higher	 than	 their	 peers	 from	 the	 same
geographical	 area	 with	 comparable	 circumstances;	 and	 (3)	 water	 users	 who	 apply	 for	 any	 state	 administered
grant,	loan	or	cost-share	moneys	for	water-related	projects.	Prior	to	requiring	the	adoption	and	implementation	of
conservation	 plans	 and	 practices,	 the	 chief	 engineer	 shall	 assess	 the	 availability	 of	 technical	 assistance	 and
inform	the	owner	of	a	water	right	or	permit	to	appropriate	water	for	beneficial	use	or	the	applicant	 for	such	a
permit	 who	 is	 required	 to	 adopt	 and	 implement	 a	 conservation	 plan	 and	 practices	 of	 the	 available	 sources	 of
technical	assistance	to	prepare	the	conservation	plan.

(b) The	chief	engineer	shall	allow	the	owner	of	a	water	right	or	permit	to	appropriate	water	for	beneficial
use	or	the	applicant	for	such	a	permit	a	minimum	of	60	days	to	prepare	a	required	conservation	plan.	The	time
allowed	to	prepare	the	required	conservation	plan	may	be	extended	by	the	chief	engineer	for	good	cause	shown
by	the	applicant.	The	chief	engineer	shall	provide	the	owner	of	the	water	right	or	permit	to	appropriate	water	for
beneficial	use	or	the	applicant	for	such	a	permit	a	reasonable	time	to	implement	the	conservation	plan	and,	for
good	cause	shown,	such	as	the	need	to	apply	extensive	land	treatment	practices,	the	chief	engineer	may	extend
the	time	for	implementation	for	a	period	of	up	to	five	years.

(c) Plans	 and	 practices	 required	 pursuant	 to	 this	 section	 shall	 be	 consistent	 with	 the	 guidelines	 for
conservation	plans	and	practices	developed	and	maintained	by	the	Kansas	water	office	pursuant	to	subsection	(c)
of	K.S.A.	74-2608	and	amendments	thereto.	If	requested	by	the	owner	of	the	water	right	or	permit	to	appropriate
water	for	beneficial	use	or	the	applicant	for	such	a	permit,	the	chief	engineer,	in	consultation	with	the	director	of
the	 Kansas	 water	 office,	 shall	 determine	 whether	 such	 plans	 and	 practices	 are	 consistent	 with	 the	 guidelines
adopted	 by	 the	 Kansas	 water	 office.	 The	 Kansas	 water	 office	 shall	 provide,	 or	 arrange	 to	 provide,	 technical
assistance	 for	water	users	 required	 to	 adopt	 and	 implement	 conservation	plans	and	practices	pursuant	 to	 this
section.

(d) Before	any	state	agency	makes	any	loan	or	grant,	or	provides	any	cost-share	funds,	for	any	water-related
projects	 to	 any	 person	 or	 entity,	 the	 state	 agency	 may	 require	 the	 person	 or	 entity	 to	 submit	 to,	 and	 have
approved	by,	the	chief	engineer	a	water	conservation	plan	consistent	with	the	guidelines	for	conservation	plans
and	practices	developed	and	maintained	by	the	Kansas	water	office	pursuant	to	subsection	(c)	of	K.S.A.	74-2608
and	amendments	thereto.

(e) As	 used	 in	 this	 section,	 "water-related	 projects"	 shall	 include,	 but	 not	 be	 limited	 to,	 the	 following:
Interconnections	 between	 water	 supply	 systems;	 development	 of	 new	 water	 supply	 and	 delivery	 systems;
improvements	or	repairs	to	an	existing	water	supply	system,	sanitary	sewer	system	or	water	treatment	system,
which	would	significantly	 increase	the	amount	of	water	used;	small	 lakes	development,	 improvement	or	repair;
and	development	of	other	small	impoundments	for	public	water	supply	or	irrigation.

(f) The	chief	engineer	may	approve	the	conservation	plans	and	practices	required	pursuant	to	the	provisions
of	this	section	on	such	terms,	conditions	and	limitations	as	deemed	necessary	to	carry	out	the	provisions	of	this
section.	 The	 implementation	 of	 the	 conservation	 plan	 and	 practices	 as	 approved	 or	 any	 subsequent	 approved
modification	shall	constitute	a	condition	of	the	water	right	or	permit	to	appropriate	water	for	beneficial	use.

(g) Any	conservation	plans	and	practices	required	pursuant	to	this	section	with	regard	to	any	groundwater
right	or	permit	 to	appropriate	groundwater	 from	within	 the	boundaries	of	a	groundwater	management	district
shall	 be	 subject	 to	 approval	 by	 both	 the	 chief	 engineer	 and	 the	 board	 of	 directors	 of	 the	 groundwater
management	district	unless	such	plans	and	practices	are	incorporated	in	the	groundwater	management	district's
management	 program	 which	 has	 been	 approved	 by	 the	 chief	 engineer	 pursuant	 to	 K.S.A.	 82a-1029	 and
amendments	thereto.

(h) The	chief	engineer	may	delegate	authority	to	implement	and	enforce	any	of	the	provisions	of	this	section
to	 a	 groundwater	 management	 district	 on	 such	 terms	 as	 may	 be	 appropriate	 and	 necessary	 to	 carry	 out	 the
provisions	of	this	section	within	the	boundaries	of	such	district.

(i) The	chief	engineer	may	delegate	to	any	city	which	has	conservation	plans	meeting	state	guidelines	the
authority	 to	 require	 domestic	 water	 users	 within	 such	 city	 to	 adopt	 and	 implement	 conservation	 plans	 and
practices	so	that	such	city	can	require	compliance	from	private	domestic	well	owners	within	the	city	limits.

(j) This	section	shall	be	part	of	and	supplemental	to	the	Kansas	water	appropriation	act.
History: L.	1991,	ch.	292,	§	5;	July	1.


